
A Soviet View of Structuralism, Althusser, and Foucault 
 

By V. E. Koslovskii 
 
Excerpts from the article “Structuralizm I dialekticheskii materialism,” Filosofskie Nauki, 1970, 
no. 1, pp. 177-182.  This article gives V. E. Koslovskii‟s summaries of speeches given at a 
conference on structuralism in Moscow in March, 1969. 
 

…. 
 
[177] The report of V. E. Koslovskii (Academy 
of Social Science), entitled “On the relation of 
the dialectical method to the structural me-
thod,” noted the unfounded claims by foreign 
representatives of a universal and general me-
thodological significance and applicability of 
the structural method.  
 His report highlighted three basic prin-
ciples of structuralism: 
 

1. Structural analysis is legitimate only 
when it is comprehensive, that is, 
when it permits maintaining the 
completeness of a system in all its 
manifestations. 

2. Any structure consists of relations 
constructed according to the prin-
ciple of the additivity of elements.  

3. It is necessary to strictly differen-
tiate the synchronic viewpoint, that 
is, the consideration of the content 
of a system at a given moment, 
from the diachronic viewpoint, 
which considers the history of the 
system. This differentiation pre-
serves the methodological priority of 
the synchronic viewpoint, since in-
ner connections must be known in 
advance in order to understand the 
evolutionary process. 
 

Many representatives of contemporary 
foreign philosophy, not only of bourgeois 
philosophy, but also Marxists (or those who 
call themselves Marxists) agree that the 
structural method in social science is a 
scientific method, and, as such, it interacts 
with the dialectical method. Moreover, this 
interaction, although is can be interpreted 
otherwise, is in essence this: Dialectics 
should be “structurized,” that is, renovated 
with the help of the structural method. In 

particular, this is the idea of L. Althusser 
and M. Godelier in France. The structural 
method is declared to be the only method 
for saving dialectics, “transforming dialec-
tics into a science,” and “rethinking Marx-
ism.” In other words, structuralism is raised 
to the rank of the only scientific method. 

In V. E. Koslovskii‟s opinion, in order to 
seriously work out all these claims, without 
either declaring the structural method to be 
anathema or singing “halleluiah” in its hon-
or, as some philosophers do, it is neces-
sary to compare judgments on the most 
important theoretical questions, as they are 
made by the dialectical and the structural 
methods. 

The most essential divergence between 
the dialectical and structural methods is 
found on the main point—the question of 
contradiction. 

Representatives of structuralism like M. 
Godelier claim that re-reading Marx shows 
that his understanding of the essence of 
the capitalist economic system reduces to 
a combination of two irreconcilable struc-
tures, the productive forces and the rela-
tions of production. The contradictions be-
tween these structures, however, are not 
contradictions inside a structure but be-
tween two structures, since they are irre-
concilable, and cannot have unity. 

According to this conception, the 
source of development of every system is 
not internal, but external (an external rela-
tion of one structure to another). Conse-
quently, to conform to the main principle of 
structuralism—the priority of the synchronic 
over the diachronic—the main principle of 
dialectics—the self-development and self-
movement of objects, as a result of the de-
velopment of their internal contradictions—
is rejected. The resolution of contradictions 
depends on the level of “compatibility” or 
“incompatibility” between the two systems 



(the productive forces and the relations of 
production). Moreover, this resolution of 
contradictions is connected only with the 
level of development of the forces of pro-
duction. Subjective factors, class struggle, 
and revolution are in fact ignored. 

Godelier also claims (wrongly) that con-
tradictions in phenomena are absent at the 
moment of their origin, and only appear at 
a certain stage of development. This leads 
to the conclusions that (a) the more intense 
the contradiction between the productive 
forces and the relations of production be-
come, the greater the tendency to stagna-
tion, and that (b) the absence of contradic-
tion determines accelerated development 
of the productive forces.  

Life refutes these conclusions. In the 
epoch of the domination of state monopoly 
capitalism, when contradictions in the 
mode of production are particularly sharp, 
the forces of production in general are de-
veloped even more quickly than in the pre-
ceding stages of the development of capi-
talism. It is also well known that contradic-
tions in the capitalist mode of production 
arose from the moment of its appearance, 
and its growth then was contradictory, as it 
is now, accompanied by growth and de-
struction of the forces of production. Thus, 
in resolving the issue of any scientific me-
thod, the analysis of contradictions, the di-
alectical and structural methods diverge 
sharply.  

This divergence also comes to light in 
the relation of the logical and the historical 
in cognition. Here, the errors of structuralist 
philosophy include investigating the logical 
and the historical in isolation from one 
another, by decisively ignoring the histori-
cal. It is well known, however, that the logi-
cal aspects of things comes to be con-
ceived only when it is combined with the 
historical aspect, which is its basis.  

The dialectical method also differs from 
the historical method on the question of the 
relation of internal and external. 

A number of representatives of structu-
ralism consider that their approach to this 
question (in particular, structures always 
include inner, hidden relations beyond the 
limits of visible relations) is in agreement 
with dialectics. There is an essential differ-

ence here, however. For example, in the 
structuralists‟ view, contradictions between 
the productive forces and the relations of 
production do not express a true relation of 
people, since the structural method oppos-
es structure and process, but human rela-
tions concern a purely external area of 
ideological consciousness. Differing from 
this point of view, Marxism does not sepa-
rate structure from process, releasing the 
relations between people from relations be-
tween things, and making the cognition of 
these relations a scientific subject. 

In deciding the question of causality, 
the dialectical and structural methods also 
stand opposed. Some structuralists directly 
deny causal connections between infra-
structure and superstructure, that is, be-
tween the economic base and social con-
sciousness—i.e., ideology.  

Even such a brief examination of the 
different approaches to the important prob-
lems makes the conclusion of the lecturer 
convincing, that the structural method can-
not be a general methodological method, 
since its understanding and resolution of 
basic philosophical questions does is not 
confirmed in science and practice. The 
structural method, this non-dialectical me-
thod, operates in large part [179] by frozen, 
unmoving categories, although that does 
not give a basis for ignoring it. It is neces-
sary to be led by the words of Lenin, who 
taught us to cut off the reactionary side of 
any trend in the science of bourgeois socie-
ty, maintaining and using everything valua-
ble and useful that it has in it. The anti-
dialectical tendency that is met with in 
some representatives of structuralism is 
explained to a certain extent by the inade-
quate working out of dialectics, where di-
alectics does not always make progress in 
generalizing a whole series of new 
branches of science and new discoveries, 
of which there is such a wealth in our time.  

…. 
 
[180] The speech of Assistant Profes-

sor L. M. Minaev (Academy of Social 
Science) was in connection with the theme 
“Structuralism on nationalism and interna-
tionalism.” 



In the opinion of L. M. Minaev, the facts 
from recent years show that some interpre-
tations of structuralism promote the spread 
of nationalist views. Thus certain ideas of 
Levi-Strauss open the way the exaggera-
tion of national and regional differences, to 
absolutizing differences in the psychologi-
cal [181] constitution of peoples and na-
tions, and to denying the unity of human 
history. Levi-Strauss and some other struc-
turalists, reflecting on the “positive quali-
ties” of so-called exotic societies, revive the 
Rousseauian tradition of admiration for 
“uncivilized peoples.”  

Similar views inspire some African 
theorists to oppose the poetry and mythol-
ogy of Africa to the spiritual values of Euro-
pean culture, even including Marxism.  

With regard to another representative 
of structuralism, Michel Foucault, who li-
mited Marxism to the 19th Century, also 
held that Adam Smith and Marx belonged 
to the same thought structure. On the basis 
of similar views, he easily came to the con-
clusion that class and political differences 
between the USSR and the USA, for ex-
ample, do not play a significant role, since 
it is a question of one and the same 
thought structure. In their representations 
of the development of humanity, Foucault 
and Levi-Strauss, as well as their student 
Lucien Sebag, proceed from the view that it 
is not material production and not practice 
that play the defining role:  the predomin-
ance belongs to language, as well as to the 
subconscious and the unconscious. 

Conclusion: we must not put excessive 
emphasis on the sympathy for Marxism of 
many representatives of structuralism, 
since structuralists receive bows from all 
sides, from positivists, Freudians, and ad-
vocates of the theory of convergence.  

Presenting a report on the theme of 
“Structuralism and Personality,” M. N. 
Gretskii (philosophy department, Moscow 
State University) first of all expressed his 
disagreement with a series of proposals in 
the speech of L. M. Minaev, and in particu-
lar that in his evaluation of Levi-Strauss, 
the charge of nationalism is at least un-
founded. He also expressed regret about 
the mixing of structuralism (either concrete 
scientific or philosophical structuralism) 

with the structural method in some speech-
es. 

Characterizing structuralism briefly as a 
tendency affecting several humanitarian 
sciences in France, M. N. Gretskii singled 
out in it a basic feature, the primacy of rela-
tions over the elements related.  This new 
feature of structuralism is connected with 
its success in concrete sciences and also 
its unresolved problems, among which are 
two main ones: the relations of structure 
and history and of structure and man. An 
example which illustrates the primacy of re-
lations is a musical melody, in which he re-
lation between notes is invariant, defined 
by the notes themselves, M. N. Gretskii 
pointed out how this idea “works” in linguis-
tics and ethnology and how it leads to the 
idea of unconsciousness structures, deter-
mining the conscious actions of man. Here 
the transition is completed from partly 
scientific structuralism to the acceptance in 
principle of philosophical structuralism.  

Speaking against the subjective idealist 
philosophy that had been dominant in 
France up to that time, structuralists op-
pose the free conscious activity of the sub-
ject to subjectless objective structures, 
consisting of pure relations without differ-
ences of substrate. The contemporary hu-
man sciences, as Levi-Strauss said, “dis-
solved” man. They attack man from the in-
side and the outside. From the point of 
view of the structuralist interpretation of 
psychoanalysis (Jacques Lacan), uncons-
cious symbolic structures constitute man 
himself. From the point of view of the struc-
turalist reinterpretation of Marxism (Louis 
Althusser), man as an element of a system 
is fully determined by social relations, leav-
ing to him only the role is as the “bearer” of 
these relations.  Hence the logical conclu-
sion of the idea of “theoretical anti-
humanism,” with which, of course, it is im-
possible to agree.  

Althusser‟s conception, which is wide-
spread in France, requires serious analy-
sis, particularly because the idea of reduc-
ing the human individual to social relations 
looks at first glance to be fully Marxist. 
Sometimes this position even “becomes 
more specific,” indicating that the essence 
of man reduces to specific social relations. 



But his also means reducing man to rela-
tions or representing him as formless clay. 
In fact, man is the product of all preceding 
development, determined not only by spe-
cific social relations, but also by all of histo-
ry, and because of this has relative inde-
pendence.  

The problem of the relation of structu-
ralism, system-structural methods and nat-
ural science was reflected in the speeches 
of S. T. Meliukhin (Moscow State Universi-
ty) and R. S. Karpinskoi (Institute of Philos-
ophy of the Academy of Science of the 
USSR). 

Professor S. T. Meliukhin considered 
that system-structural methods comprise in 
themselves consideration of material ob-
jects and processes on account of a whole 
variety of their inner and outer connections, 
and interactions of elements in a specific 
material system or process, on account of 
the place of the specific object in the gen-
eral series of actions. Structural analysis 
also presupposes the emergence of laws of 
change of systems and of the change in 
the mutual connection of the elements that 
constitute them. Moreover, these laws 
should be revealed not only as of a gener-
al, qualitative type, but possibly also quan-
titative, giving the basis for exact predic-
tions by way of definite equations.  

One of the most important problems of 
system-structural analysis is the investiga-
tion of the mutual relation of the characte-
ristics of systems and the elements they 
contain. It is well known that these proper-
ties are qualitatively different, and in most 
cases, from the basic properties of the pri-
mitive structural elements, it is very difficult 
to predict theoretically beforehand [182] 
what properties a newly arising whole sys-
tem will possess. The properties of such a 
system are usually established empirically 
and after its emergence. For this, many 
properties of the elements are inadequately 
combined for the formation of the whole 
system.  If bringing out theoretical prin-
ciples defining this inadequacy and reveal-
ing the way to predict the properties of the 
whole were successful, it would be an 
enormous step forward in the scientific 
cognition of the world, in particular, in re-

vealing the content of the process of devel-
opment and the formation of new qualities.  

The basic positions of system-structural 
methods were already formed in other ter-
minology in preceding philosophical theo-
ries of cognition and its methods, and have 
found their clearest expression in dialectic-
al materialism. But the system-structural 
method reveals the significance of these 
principles from a new perspective, from the 
point of view of the achievements and 
needs of contemporary natural science, 
above all in connection with the working out 
of the general theory of systems.  The sys-
tem-structural method must not be identi-
fied with structuralism, which often puts 
forward metaphysical and idealistic con-
ceptions, in contradistinction to dialectical 
materialism. 

 
…. 

 
The last speech in the discussion was 

devoted to the theme of “structuralism and 
organization.” A. E. Voskoboinikov, (Kom-
somol Higher School), speaking on this 
theme, polemicized in particular with G. M. 
Gak, who considered the structural method 
to be something established in philosophy 
long ago. Although the word „structure,‟ A. 
E. Voskoboinikov said, also was encoun-
tered already among the ancient Greeks, it 
then had nothing in common with the con-
temporary understanding of structure, since 
the basic idea of structuralism is the media-
tion of parts, elements of any whole.  

A. E. Voskoboinikov considers that 
there is no contradiction between dialectics 
and the synchronic approach if it is correct-
ly understood. Synchrony is characterized 
not as something opposed to dialectics, but 
as something opposed to historicism, and 
historicism is not dialectics. 

The general conclusion that resulted 
from the discussion was that the structural 
method requires profound study and major 
investigative work, because of its un-
doubted significance in the development of 
many branches of science.  

Along with that we must not lose a criti-
cal approach, and must be principled in 
evaluation of the method, its relations with 
dialectical methods, and most important, 



we must not forget that some bourgeois 
ideologists give the structural method their 
interpretation, tending to use it in the whole 
struggle against Marxism and its philoso-
phy.  

Those taking part in the discussion ex-
pressed the desire to continue and broaden 

the discussion of the problems of the 
structural method in theoretical confe-
rences and in print.  

 


